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DIRECTIVE 55.1 
VICTIM / WITNESS ASSISTANCE 

ADMINISTRATION 
 

Issue Date: 05/13/2020 By Order of Chief of Police 
Rescinds:  (Issue 07/24/2009) 

Pages:  7 
CALEA Standards 

Referenced: 55.1.1 & 55.1.2 
 

This directive consists of the following sections: 
 
55.1.1 Victim / Witness Assistance 
55.1.2 Review Need / Services - Elected 20% 
 
POLICY AND PROCEDURE: 
 
Miami Township Police Department is committed to the development, implementation 
and perpetuation of appropriate victim and witness assistance programs and activities, 
which will provide victim and witnesses of crime with all reasonable assistance to protect 
the victim/witness from harm or further injury; nurture cooperation between police and 
victim/witness and enhance willingness of the victim/witness to assist in prosecutions.   
 
55.1.1  Victim / Witness Assistance 
 
Delivery of Victim/Witness Assistance by Agency Personnel 
 
Upon first contact with a victim/witness the officer should make an assessment of the 
person’s immediate needs.  These needs may range from reassurance from the officer to 
emergency medical care.  The officer should respond quickly, listen attentively, show 
concern, reassure and help the person overcome their sense of fear and helplessness.  
Officers should avoid insensitive and unnecessary questioning and any comments, 
attitudes or actions that suggest the person contributed to their victimization.   
 
Miami Township Police Department maintains victim of crime packets that contain 
information and resources available at both the State and County level.  Officers will 
supply information to the victim/witness about applicable rights and services that are 
available to them.   
 
Miami Township Police Department maintains a list of resource agencies to provide 
employees of the department with a reference of agencies to which persons can be 
referred for assistance, when the assistance is requested or required. 
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Confidentiality of Victim/Witnesses in Case Development 

Victim/Witness records will remain confidential pursuant to Ohio Revised Code 149.43.  
Confidential law enforcement investigatory record means any record that pertains to a 
law enforcement matter of a criminal, quasi-criminal, civil, or administrative nature, but 
only to the extent that the release of the record would create a high probability of 
disclosure of any of the following: 

• The identity of a suspect who has not been charged with the offense to which the 
record pertains, or of an information source or witness to whom confidentiality 
has been reasonably promised. 

• Information provided by an information source or witness to whom 
confidentiality has been reasonably promised, which information would 
reasonably tend to disclose the source’s or witness’s identity. 

• Specific confidential investigatory techniques or procedures or specific 
investigatory work product. 

• Information that would endanger the life or physical safety of law enforcement 
personnel, a crime victim, a witness, or a confidential information source. 

Agency Efforts to Inform Public and Media of Assistance Services 
 
The Miami Township Police will periodically inform the public and media services of the 
Department’s victim/witness assistance services.  The Support Services Supervisor shall 
be responsible for informing the public through the news media, articles, brochures or 
other appropriate means of rights and availability of victim/witness services.   
 
Relationship Between Agency and Victim/Witness Efforts of Other Agencies & 
Organizations 
 
In Ohio, statewide organizations and local agencies exist to assist victim/witnesses in 
dealing with the emotional, financial and legal consequences of victimization.  The Ohio 
Attorney General Crime Victim Services Section, the Clermont County Prosecutor and 
the YMCA Court Advocacy Program have victim witness services available.  The 
Investigations Supervisor shall be responsible for these liaison efforts and for maintaining 
an ongoing channel of communication by which to offer or receive suggestions about 
how the department can effectively work with these outside sources to better serve the 
victim/witness.   
 
Summary of Victim and Witness Rights 
 
Ohio Revised Code 109.42, Compilation of Statues Relative to Victim’s Rights  
 
ORC 109.42 is a compilation of all statues relative to victim’s and witnesses’ rights in the 
State of Ohio.   
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(A) The attorney general shall prepare and have printed a pamphlet that contains a 
compilation of all statutes relative to victim’s rights in which the attorney general lists 
and explains the statutes in the form of a victim’s bill of rights. The attorney general shall 
distribute the pamphlet to all sheriffs, marshals, municipal corporation and township 
police departments, constables, and other law enforcement agencies, to all prosecuting 
attorneys, city directors of law, village solicitors, and other similar chief legal officers of 
municipal corporations, and to organizations that represent or provide services for victims 
of crime. The victim’s bill of rights set forth in the pamphlet shall contain a description of 
all of the rights of victims that are provided for in Chapter 2930 or in any other section of 
the Revised Code and shall include, but not be limited to, all of the following: 
 
(1) The right of a victim or a victim’s representative to attend a proceeding before a grand 
jury, in a juvenile case, or in a criminal case pursuant to a subpoena without being 
discharged from the victim’s or representative’s employment, having the victim’s or 
representative’s employment terminated, having the victim’s or representative’s pay 
decreased or withheld, or otherwise being punished, penalized, or threatened as a result of 
time lost from regular employment because of the victim’s or representative’s attendance 
at the proceeding pursuant to the subpoena, as set forth in section 2151.211, 2930.18, 
2939.121, or 2945.451 of the Revised Code; 
 
(2) The potential availability pursuant to section 2151.359 or 2152.61 of the Revised 
Code of a forfeited recognizance to pay damages caused by a child when the delinquency 
of the child or child’s violation of probation or community control is found to be 
proximately caused by the failure of the child’s parent or guardian to subject the child to 
reasonable parental authority or to faithfully discharge the conditions of probation or 
community control; 
 
(3) The availability of awards of reparations pursuant to sections 2743.51 to 2743.72 of 
the Revised Code for injuries caused by criminal offenses; 
 
(4) The right of the victim in certain criminal or juvenile cases or a victim’s 
representative to receive, pursuant to section 2930.06 of the Revised Code, notice of the 
date, time, and place of the trial or delinquency proceeding in the case or, if there will not 
be a trial or delinquency proceeding, information from the prosecutor, as defined in 
section 2930.01 of the Revised Code, regarding the disposition of the case; 
 
(5) The right of the victim in certain criminal or juvenile cases or a victim’s 
representative to receive, pursuant to section 2930.04, 2930.05, or 2930.06 of the Revised 
Code, notice of the name of the person charged with the violation, the case or docket 
number assigned to the charge, and a telephone number or numbers that can be called to 
obtain information about the disposition of the case; 
 
(6) The right of the victim in certain criminal or juvenile cases or of the victim’s 
representative pursuant to section 2930.13 or 2930.14 of the Revised Code, subject to any 
reasonable terms set by the court as authorized under section 2930.14 of the Revised 
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Code, to make a statement about the victimization and, if applicable, a statement relative 
to the sentencing or disposition of the offender; 
 
(7) The opportunity to obtain a court order, pursuant to section 2945.04 of the Revised 
Code, to prevent or stop the commission of the offense of intimidation of a crime victim 
or witness or an offense against the person or property of the complainant, or of the 
complainant’s ward or child; 
 
(8) The right of the victim in certain criminal or juvenile cases or a victim’s 
representative pursuant to sections 2151.38, 2929.20, 2930.10, 2930.16, and 2930.17 of 
the Revised Code to receive notice of a pending motion for judicial release or early 
release of the person who committed the offense against the victim, to make an oral or 
written statement at the court hearing on the motion, and to be notified of the court’s 
decision on the motion; 
 
(9) The right of the victim in certain criminal or juvenile cases or a victim’s 
representative pursuant to section 2930.16, 2967.12, 2967.26, or 5139.56 of the Revised 
Code to receive notice of any pending commutation, pardon, parole, transitional control, 
discharge, other form of authorized release, post-release control, or supervised release for 
the person who committed the offense against the victim or any application for release of 
that person and to send a written statement relative to the victimization and the pending 
action to the adult parole authority or the release authority of the department of youth 
services; 
 
(10) The right of the victim to bring a civil action pursuant to sections 2969.01 to 2969.06 
of the Revised Code to obtain money from the offender’s profit fund; 
 
(11) The right, pursuant to section 3109.09 of the Revised Code, to maintain a civil action 
to recover compensatory damages not exceeding ten thousand dollars and costs from the 
parent of a minor who willfully damages property through the commission of an act that 
would be a theft offense, as defined in section 2913.01 of the Revised Code, if committed 
by an adult; 
 
(12) The right, pursuant to section 3109.10 of the Revised Code, to maintain a civil action 
to recover compensatory damages not exceeding ten thousand dollars and costs from the 
parent of a minor who willfully and maliciously assaults a person; 
 
(13) The possibility of receiving restitution from an offender or a delinquent child 
pursuant to section 2152.20, 2929.18, or 2929.28 of the Revised Code; 
 
(14) The right of the victim in certain criminal or juvenile cases or a victim’s 
representative, pursuant to section 2930.16 of the Revised Code, to receive notice of the 
escape from confinement or custody of the person who committed the offense, to receive 
that notice from the custodial agency of the person at the victim’s last address or 
telephone number provided to the custodial agency, and to receive notice that, if either 
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the victim’s address or telephone number changes, it is in the victim’s interest to provide 
the new address or telephone number to the custodial agency; 
 
(15) The right of a victim of domestic violence to seek the issuance of a civil protection 
order pursuant to section 3113.31 of the Revised Code, the right of a victim of a violation 
of section 2903.14, 2909.06, 2909.07, 2911.12, 2911.211, or 2919.22 of the Revised 
Code, a violation of a substantially similar municipal ordinance, or an offense of violence 
who is a family or household member of the offender at the time of the offense to seek 
the issuance of a temporary protection order pursuant to section 2919.26 of the Revised 
Code, and the right of both types of victims to be accompanied by a victim advocate 
during court proceedings; 
 
(16) The right of a victim of a sexually oriented offense or of a child-victim oriented 
offense that is committed by a person who is convicted of, pleads guilty to, or is 
adjudicated a delinquent child for committing the offense and who is in a category 
specified in division (B) of section 2950.10 of the Revised Code to receive, pursuant to 
that section, notice that the person has registered with a sheriff under section 2950.04, 
2950.041, or 2950.05 of the Revised Code and notice of the person’s name, the person’s 
residence that is registered, and the offender’s school, institution of higher education, or 
place of employment address or addresses that are registered, the person’s photograph, 
and a summary of the manner in which the victim must make a request to receive the 
notice. As used in this division, “sexually oriented offense” and “child-victim oriented 
offense” have the same meanings as in section 2950.01 of the Revised Code. 
 
(17) The right of a victim of certain sexually violent offenses committed by an offender 
who also is convicted of or pleads guilty to a sexually violent predator specification and 
who is sentenced to a prison term pursuant to division (A)(3) of section 2971.03 of the 
Revised Code, of a victim of a violation of division (A)(1)(b) of section 2907.02 of the 
Revised Code committed on or after January 2, 2007, by an offender who is sentenced for 
the violation pursuant to division (B)(1)(a), (b), or (c) of section 2971.03 of the Revised 
Code, of a victim of an attempted rape committed on or after January 2, 2007, by an 
offender who also is convicted of or pleads guilty to a specification of the type described 
in section 2941.1418, 2941.1419, or 2941.1420 of the Revised Code and is sentenced for 
the violation pursuant to division (B)(2)(a), (b), or (c) of section 2971.03 of the Revised 
Code, and of a victim of an offense that is described in division (B)(3)(a), (b), (c), or (d) 
of section 2971.03 of the Revised Code and is committed by an offender who is 
sentenced pursuant to one of those divisions to receive, pursuant to section 2930.16 of the 
Revised Code, notice of a hearing to determine whether to modify the requirement that 
the offender serve the entire prison term in a state correctional facility, whether to 
continue, revise, or revoke any existing modification of that requirement, or whether to 
terminate the prison term. As used in this division, “sexually violent offense” and 
“sexually violent predator specification” have the same meanings as in section 2971.01 of 
the Revised Code. 
 
(B)(1)(a) Subject to division (B)(1)(c) of this section, a prosecuting attorney, assistant 
prosecuting attorney, city director of law, assistant city director of law, village solicitor, 
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assistant village solicitor, or similar chief legal officer of a municipal corporation or an 
assistant of any of those officers who prosecutes an offense committed in this state, upon 
first contact with the victim of the offense, the victim’s family, or the victim’s 
dependents, shall give the victim, the victim’s family, or the victim’s dependents a copy 
of the pamphlet prepared pursuant to division (A) of this section and explain, upon 
request, the information in the pamphlet to the victim, the victim’s family, or the victim’s 
dependents. 
 
(b) Subject to division (B)(1)(c) of this section, a law enforcement agency that 
investigates an offense or delinquent act committed in this state shall give the victim of 
the offense or delinquent act, the victim’s family, or the victim’s dependents a copy of 
the pamphlet prepared pursuant to division (A) of this section at one of the following 
times: 
 
(i) Upon first contact with the victim, the victim’s family, or the victim’s dependents; 
 
(ii) If the offense or delinquent act is an offense of violence, if the circumstances of the 
offense or delinquent act and the condition of the victim, the victim’s family, or the 
victim’s dependents indicate that the victim, the victim’s family, or the victim’s 
dependents will not be able to understand the significance of the pamphlet upon first 
contact with the agency, and if the agency anticipates that it will have an additional 
contact with the victim, the victim’s family, or the victim’s dependents, upon the 
agency’s second contact with the victim, the victim’s family, or the victim’s dependents. 
 
If the agency does not give the victim, the victim’s family, or the victim’s dependents a 
copy of the pamphlet upon first contact with them and does not have a second contact 
with the victim, the victim’s family, or the victim’s dependents, the agency shall mail a 
copy of the pamphlet to the victim, the victim’s family, or the victim’s dependents at 
their last known address. 
 
(c) In complying on and after December 9, 1994, with the duties imposed by division 
(B)(1)(a) or (b) of this section, an official or a law enforcement agency shall use copies of 
the pamphlet that are in the official’s or agency’s possession on December 9, 1994, until 
the official or agency has distributed all of those copies. After the official or agency has 
distributed all of those copies, the official or agency shall use only copies of the pamphlet 
that contain at least the information described in divisions (A)(1) to (17) of this section. 
 
(2) The failure of a law enforcement agency or of a prosecuting attorney, assistant 
prosecuting attorney, city director of law, assistant city director of law, village solicitor, 
assistant village solicitor, or similar chief legal officer of a municipal corporation or an 
assistant to any of those officers to give, as required by division (B)(1) of this section, the 
victim of an offense or delinquent act, the victim’s family, or the victim’s dependents a 
copy of the pamphlet prepared pursuant to division (A) of this section does not give the 
victim, the victim’s family, the victim’s dependents, or a victim’s representative any 
rights under section 2743.51 to 2743.72, 2945.04, 2967.12, 2969.01 to 2969.06, 3109.09, 
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or 3109.10 of the Revised Code or under any other provision of the Revised Code and 
does not affect any right under those sections. 
 
(3) A law enforcement agency, a prosecuting attorney or assistant prosecuting attorney, 
or a city director of law, assistant city director of law, village solicitor, assistant village 
solicitor, or similar chief legal officer of a municipal corporation that distributes a copy 
of the pamphlet prepared pursuant to division (A) of this section shall not be required to 
distribute a copy of an information card or other printed material provided by the clerk of 
the court of claims pursuant to section 2743.71 of the Revised Code. 
 
(C) The cost of printing and distributing the pamphlet prepared pursuant to division (A) 
of this section shall be paid out of the reparations fund, created pursuant to section 
2743.191 of the Revised Code, in accordance with division (D) of that section. 
 
(D) As used in this section: 
 
(1) “Victim’s representative” has the same meaning as in section 2930.01 of the Revised 
Code; 
 
(2) “Victim advocate” has the same meaning as in section 2919.26 of the Revised Code. 
 
55.1.2  Review Need / Services – Elected 20% 
 
Miami Township Police Department has elected this as a 20% Standard for Review 
Need/Services. 
 

 


